
Friday, December 17, 2021

Minority Woman Owned Business (MWB)

Interlocal Cooperative Contracting

UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT 
DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT COST COST COST COST COST COST COST COST

1.00 Clarifloc C-6232 Polymer Tote No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,565.00  $1.55/LB X2300 
LBS/TOTE 

$3,550.00

 UOM is one - 
275 gallon 

tote.  
Chemnation 

product name 
is F-2306 

No Bid

2.00 Sodium Hypochlorite Aqueous Solution Gallon No Bid No Bid $2.03 $1.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.00 Aluminum Sulfate, Technical Grade Gallon $0.863 No Bid No Bid $0.985 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.32

 For 
conversion 

purposes only, 
price equates 
to $485.39 per 

d  t  
4.00 Sodium Permanganate 20% Solution Drum No Bid $1,307.35 No Bid $996.40 $773.80  4 drum / minimum 

order No Bid No Bid No Bid

Disagree

Shannon Chemical Corporation
Malvern, PA

No

PVS Minibulk, Inc.
Detroit, MI

No

BID TAB

Mesquite, TX 
Yes

WATER AND WASTEWATER CHEMICALS
RFB 2021-001

CITY OF PFLUGERVILLE

Chameleon Industries, Inc.

Disagree Disagree

Brenntag Southwest, Inc.
Lancaster, TX 

No

Disagree

Chemrite, Inc.
Malvern, PA

Yes

Agree

Polydyne, Inc.
Riceboro, GA

No

Chemtrade Chemicals US, LL
Parsippany, NJ

No
Agree / Might need to make 
adjustments to price due to 
difference in freight or load 

type/size

Agree

ChemNation, Inc.
Spring, TX 

Yes

Agree
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