
Tuesday, September 13, 2022

Minority Woman Owned Business (MWB)
Interlocal
I. BASE BID
PROPOSAL

BID ESTIMATED UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
NUMBER DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL

1.01 Sodium Bisulfite Aqueous Sol. 12 Totes No Bid No Bid 3,145.00$          37,740.00$            No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1.02 Sodium Hypochlorite Aqueos Sol. 120000 Gal No Bid No Bid 3.95$                474,000.00$          2.30$                276,000.00$      No Bid No Bid
1.03 Aluminum Chlorhydrate Sol. (50%) 55000 Gal 5.77$                317,350.00$          No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.28$                290,400.00$          

TOTAL BID AMOUNT $ 317,350.00            $ 511,740.00            $ 276,000.00        $ 290,400.00            

No

BID TAB

Parsippany, New Jersey
No

Water & Wastewater Chemicals
RFB 2022-003

CITY OF PFLUGERVILLE

Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC

Yes

DNA Chem, Inc.
Weir, Texas

Yes
No

G2O Technologies 
Clinton, New Jersey

No
Yes

DPC Industries, Inc.
Corpus Christi, Texas

No
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