### Notice

Please note that solicitations issued prior to July 13, 2016 can be found here: http://legacy.texasbidsystem.com



Solicitation Number

2019-1

Title

Water and Wastewater Chemicals

**Basic Information** 

Reference Number

0000198394

City of Pflugerville

**Issuing Organization** 

**Owner Organization** Solicitation Type

IFB - Invitation for Bid (Formal)

Solicitation Number

2019-1

Title

Water and Wastewater Chemicals

Source ID

PU.AG.USA.1923.C890651

Piggyback Solicitation

Yes

Details

Location

Travis County, Texas

**Purchase Type** 

Term: 10/01/2018 01:00 AM EDT - 09/30/2019 01:00 AM EDT

Option: 2 optional renewals

**Dates** 

Publication

09/12/2018 01:00 AM EDT

Questions are submitted online

**Closing Date** 

09/21/2018 03:00 PM EDT

#### **Contact Information**

Sabrina Schmidt 512-990-6140

SABRINAS@cityofpflugerville.com

### Description

The City of Pflugerville is accepting competitive sealed bids for Water and Wastewater Chemicals to be delivered to various locations, Pflugerville water treatment plant located at 17601 Weiss Lane, Pflugerville wastewater treatment plant located at 15500 Sun Light Near Way, two different water well Sites, well #6 located at 15500 Glen Rose Chase, well #7 located at Chisholm Trail, and two lift stations located at 17008 Bridgefarmer Blvd., 17901 Colorado Sands, Pflugerville, TX 78660. The bid will be for one (1) full year with optional two (2) annual renewals. Bid documents will ONLY be available for download at http://www.texasbidsystem.com. Bids are due at 2:00pm on Friday September 21, 2018. Bids must be submitted to Pflugerville City Hall, Attn. Sabrina Schmidt, 100 E. Main St. Suite 100 Pflugerville, TX 78660, or mailed to P.O. Box 589 Pflugerville, TX 78691.

### **Buyer's Requirements**

### **General Requirements**

Insurance Required

#### **Award Requirements**

- Reserve Rights to Award by Line Item

### **Bid Submission Process**

**Bid Submission Type** 

Physical Bid Submission

# Categories Selected Categories

NIGP (5)	
885	WATER AND WASTEWATER TREATING CHEMICALS
88547	Dechlorinating Agents (Sulfur Dioxide, etc.) Dechlorinating Agents, Sulfur Dioxide
88570	Hardness Control Chemicals: Chelating Agents (Phosphonates, etc.), Polyphosphates, Polymer Flocculants, etc.
88544	Corrosion, Scale, and Sludge Control Chemicals: Alum, Amines (Morpholine, etc.), Sodium Sulfite, etc.
88538	Chlorine, Liquefied Chlorine, Liquefied (In Cylinders For Water Purification), Liquefied Chlorine (In Cylinders For Water Purification), Water Purification Chlorine (Liquefied-In Cylinders)
88577	Polymer Flocculants (For Color, Thickening, Dewatering, Coagulant Aid) (Not Hardness Control) Polymer Flocculants (Not Hardness Control), Flocculants, Polymer (Not Hardness Control)

This copy of the NIGP Code is the property of the National Institute of Governmental Purchasing, Inc. (NIGP), is displayed and used by BidNet under license from Periscope Holdings, Inc. (the authorized sub-licensor of NIGP), and is protected under the copyright laws of the United States. It may not be copied or used (in whole or part) by any party unless such party is authorized to do so under the terms of a written license agreement entered into with NIGP or its authorized sub-licensors expressly authorizing such party to use the NIGP Code. Unauthorized copying or use is prohibited. Dated: January 2016

## **Documents**

### Documents

Document

Size

Uploaded Date

Language

Bid # 2019-1 Water WW Chemicals bid docs.pdf [pdf]

2 Mb

09/04/2018 04:14 PM EDT

English



City of Pflugerville

Bid Number

2019-1

Bid Title

Water and Wastewater Chemicals

Bid Start Date

September 12, 2018

Bid End Date

September 21, 2018 @ 2:00 PM

Bid Contact

Wiley Webb

Utilities Superintendent

512-990-6400

wileyw@pflugervilletx.gov

Contract Duration

1 year beginning October 1, 2018

Contract Renewal

Optional 2 Annual Renewals, upon agreement with the City of Pflugerville. (Any price increase associated with annual renewal must be justified by information related to the CPI index or other vendor cost increases.) Annual renewals are predicated on sufficient budgetary allocation by City Council for the renewal of the awarded contract. Any provision of this to this request for bids to the contrary notwithstanding, City Council shall be under no obligation to make such budgetary allocation.

Contract to begin upon acceptance from the City Council, the City of Pflugerville will issue a purchase order for the chemicals being purchased based on the bid pricing.

Standard Disclaimer

The right is reserved to accept or reject all or part of the bid, and to accept the offer considered most advantageous to the city by item or total bid. The City of Pflugerville will award to the lowest responsible bidder who provides goods or services at the best value to the city.

Company Name Chameleon Industries Inc.

# Document Request List

Organization Name	Main Contact	Download Date City		Province/State
USALCO, LLC.	Anja Doyle	09/12/2018 03:09 PM EDT	Baltimore	Maryland
Diversified Waterscapes, Inc.	Sarah Clarke	09/12/2018 11:47 AM EDT	Laguna Niguel	California
Evoqua Water Technologies LLC	Connie Curtis	09/12/2018 11:36 AM EDT	Sarasota	Florida
HASA, Inc.	Alan Lewis	09/12/2018 11:13 AM EDT	Saugus	California
Fox Scientific Inc.	Jenifer Nugen	09/12/2018 10:51 AM EDT	Alvarado	Texas
Fort Bend Services, Inc.	David James	09/12/2018 10:50 AM EDT	Stafford	Texas
Last Group Enterprises Inc	Marguerite Burton	09/12/2018 10:44 AM EDT	Arlington	Texas
forsythe brothers	john forsythe	09/12/2018 10:01 AM EDT	austin	Texas
George S. Coyne Chemical Co., Inc.	Sherry Dugan	09/12/2018 09:26 AM EDT	Croydon	Pennsylvania
Gulbrandsen Technologies inc.	Nikki Hughes	09/12/2018 09:11 AM EDT	Clinton	New Jersey
Pencco, Inc	Sarah Duffy	09/12/2018 09:07 AM EDT	San Felipe	Texas
PVS Technologies, Inc.	Eileen McDonnell	09/12/2018 08:41 AM EDT	Detroit	Michigan
Shannon Chemical Corporation	Daniel Flynn	09/12/2018 08:29 AM EDT	Malvern	Pennsylvania
amit	amit damahe	09/12/2018 03:02 AM EDT	gondia	Alabama

09/12/2018 04:05 PM EDT Page 4 of 5

## Audit

### Status History

Solicitation Status

Waiting for Publication

Publication

Date

09/04/2018 04:16 PM EDT

09/12/2018 01:08 AM EDT

City of Pflugerville Bid Number 2019-1 Water and Wastewater Chemical Bid

### Bid Information

- 1. Bid will be awarded per line item.
- 2. Supplier to deliver chemicals to, water treatment plant, wastewater treatment plant, 2 water well sites, and 2 Lift station sites.
  - delivery addresses are on the bid sheets for each chemical.
- 3. All deliveries will be unloaded and placed in the proper storage area by the supplier.
- 4. Able to deliver within 48 hours of notification.
- 5. See bid sheet for estimated annual chemical usage.
- 6. Specification sheets for each chemical attached.
- 7. Certificate of insurance must be included with bid documents.(see attached example)
- 8. Completed W9 to be returned with bid.
- 9. City of Pflugerville Purchasing rider attached.
- 10. HB 1295 attached.
- 11. Reference sheet.
- 12. Interlocal Cooperative Contracting.

All documents herein and attached are required to be Completed and returned with the response.

City of Pflugerville Bid Number: 2019-1

Water and Wastewater Chemical Bid

Tax ID No: 75-2853080 Chameleon Industries Inc. Legal Business Name: PO Box 853027 Address: Mesquite TX 75185 City State & Zip: Jason L. Garza Contact: 513-615-3808 Telephone: Corporation Business Entity Type: info@chameleonindustriesinc.com Email Address: Authorized Signature Chameleon Industries Inc. Print Name

"By the signature hereon affixed, the bidder hereby certifies that neither the bidder nor the entity represented by the bidder, or anyone acting for such entity has violated the antitrust laws of this State, codified in section 15.01 et seq., Texas Business and Commerce Code, or Federal Antitrust laws, nor communicated directly or indirectly, The bid made to any competitor or any other person engaged in such line of business."

Original bids are due to the City of Pflugerville Attn: Sabrina Schmidt 100 E Main St. Suite 100, Pflugerville, TX 78660, or mailed to City of Pflugerville Attn: Sabrina Schmidt, P.O. Box 589, Pflugerville, TX 78691.

Prior to 2 pm on September 21, 2018.

Envelopes must have bid number, opening date and time on the outside of the sealed envelope. Bidders name must also appear on the outside of the envelope.

City of Pflugerville Bid No. 2019-1 Water and Wastewater Chemical Bid Sheet

Company Name Chameleon Industries Inc.

1. Clarifloc C-6232 Polymer 3-275 gal totes Price per tote \$ No Bid Estimated (275gal)-60 totes/year Delivery address: Wastewater Treatment Plant 15500 Sun Light Near Way Pflugerville, TX 78660.
2. Sodium Bisulfite Aqueous Solution 800 gal/load Price per gallon \$ No Bid Estimated 2,000 gal/year Delivery address: Water Treatment Plant, 17601 Weiss Ln. Pflugerville, TX 78660.
2A. Sodium Bisulfite Aqueous Solution 800-1000 gal/load Price per gallon \$\frac{\textbf{No Bid}}{\text{Estimated 40,000 gal/year}}\$  Delivery address: Wastewater Treatment Plant 15500 Sun Light Near Way Pflugerville, TX 78660.
3. Aluminum Sulfate, Technical Grade 4,500-5,000 gal/load Price per gallon \$\bigset{0.605}\$ Estimated 146,000 gal/year Delivery address: Wastewater Treatment Plant 15500 Sun Light Near Way, Pflugerville, TX 78660.
4. Chlorine 4 one ton Cylinders/delivery Price per ton \$\ \bigstyle= \text{No Bid} \\ Estimated 56 tons/year \\ Delivery address: Wastewater Treatment Plant \\ 15500 Sun Light Near Way, \\ Pflugerville, TX 78660.
4 A. Chlorine 150 lb. Cylinder Price per Cylinder \$\ \text{No Bid}\$  Estimated 60 150 lb. Cylinders/year  Delivery addresses: Water well # 6 1607 Glen Rose Chase,  & Water Well # 7, Chisholm Trail, Pflugerville, TX 78660.

5. Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (LAS) 40,720 lbs. per load Price per lb. \$ 0.095 Estimated 10 loads/year Delivery Address: Water Treatment Plant 17601 Weiss Ln, Pflugerville, TX 78660.
A. Liquid Ammonium Sulfate (LAS) 55 gal/drum Price per Drum \$ No Bid Estimated 52 55gal drums/year Delivery Addresses: Water Well # 6, 1607 Glen Rose Chase, &Water Well #7, Chisholm Trail, Pflugerville, TX 78660.
6. Aluminum Chlorhydrate Solution (ACH) 45,000 lbs. per load Price per lb. \$ No Bid Estimated 8 loads/year Delivery Address: Water Treatment Plant, 17601 Weiss Ln, Pflugerville, TX 78660.
7. Salt 24 tons per load Price per ton \$\ \text{No Bid}\$  Estimated 9 loads/year  Delivery Address: Water Treatment Plant,  17601 Weiss Ln, Pflugerville, TX 78660.
8. Sodium Hyperchlorite 10% 55 gal/drum Price per Drum \$ No Bid Estimated 36 55ga drums/year Delivery Address: Water Treatment Plant, 17601 Weiss Ln, Pflugerville, TX 78660.
9. Sulfa-Clear 8411C 55 gal/drum Price per Drum \$ No Bid Estimated 30 55 gal drums/year Delivery Address: Colorado Sands Lift Station, 17901 Colorado Sands, Pflugerville, TX 78660.
A. Sulfa-Clear 8411C 300lb. Totes Price per Tote \$ No Bid Estimated (5) 300lb. Totes/year Delivery Address: Verona Lift Station Bridgefarmer Blvd., Pflugerville, TX 78660
***PRICE per chemical above MUST include all delivery/fuel charges per chemical.
Chemicals are to be delivered to the addresses specified above.  Deliveries will be between the hours 7am –4pm, Monday – Friday.
Company Name Chameleon Industries Inc.

## ALUMINUM SULFATE, TECHNICAL GRADE

## Specification Sheet

	Min.	Max.
Aluminum Oxid	e (0%) 8.25	8.51
Alum Sulfate	48.53	50.06
Appearance	(	Clear
Color	Amber, Colorless, Light Amb	er,Light Straw, Greenish Blue
Iron	0	0.35
рН	I	3
Specific Gravity	1.323	1.3352

## **QUALITY CONTROL DEPARTMENT**

### SPECIFICATION SHEET

	AS								
	713								
	QUALITY CONTROL DEPARTMENT								
	SPECIFICATION SHEET								
	PR	ODUCT							
AQUAMINE			RM5115-1GBuik						
SPECIFICATION	8PEC	CIFICATION VERSION	SPECIFICATION DATE						
		1,3000							
	PRODUCT S	PECIFICATION							
TEST		STID	REQUIREMENTS						
Ammonia as t#13	Ammonia	9.8 =< V	/alue =< 10.8						
Assay	Assay	36 =< Vi	ue =< 42						
	REA	MARKS							
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·								
	DOT M	arkings							
ON CODE	2. 1	PACKAGING GROUP	CAS RUNBER						
Not Regulates	100	HANE							
	CON	TAINS							
	Con	IAMS							
	HAZA	RO IEXT							
		10 101							

### important

The information on the three is befored to be occurate built not warranted to be up. Protective egypown), beath effects, and open residue safety measures are based on intended and entiripated productions. Recipients are arbitised to confirm in observe of need that the intermediant applicable and outside to their elementations.

Specifications

Aluminum Chlorhydrate Solution

Formula

A12(OH)5C1.2H2O

Nomenclature

Aluminum Chlorhydrate Solution (50%)

CAS Number

12042-91-0

CAS Index Name

Aluminum Hydroxychloride

Grade

Technical

210.5

Molecular Weight

Description

Aluminum Chlorhydrate Solution is clear to slightly hazy in Appearance. It meets AWWA standard ANSI/AWWA B408-03 And has been certified by the National Sanitation Foundation (NSF) For the use in the treatment of drinking water at maximum dosage

Of 250 mg/L.

Specifications

Alumina, % A1<sub>2</sub>O<sub>3</sub> 23.0-24.0

Chlorides,%C1

7.90-8.40

Basicity, %

82.5-84.5

Specific Gravity (at 60°F):

1.330-1.350

Appearance

Clear to slightly hazy solution, free of

visible foreign matter or sediment.

Turbidity,NTU

<50

### City of Pflugerville Insurance Requirements

Bidder/Proposer performing work on City property or public right-of-way for the City of Pflugerville shall provide the City a certificate of insurance evidencing the coverage provisions identified herein. Bidder/Proposer shall provide the City evidence that all subcontractors performing work on the project have the same types and amounts of coverage as required herein or that the subcontractors are included under the contractor's policy. The City, at its own discretion, may require a certified copy of the policy.

All insurance companies and coverage must be authorized by the Texas Department of Insurance to transact business in the State of Texas and must be acceptable to the City of Pflugerville.

Listed below are the types and amounts of insurance required. The City reserves the right to amend or require additional types and amounts of coverage or provisions depending on the nature of the work.

Type of Insurance	Amount of Insurance	Provisions
Commercial General (Public) Liability to include coverage for:  Premises/Operations	1,000,000 per occurrence, 2,000,000 general aggregate	City to be listed as additional insured and provide 30- days notice of cancellation or material
Products/ Completed	OI	change in coverage
Operations	2,000,000 combined single coverage limit	City to be provided a waiver of subrogation
Independent Contractors		City prefers that insurer be
Personal Injury		rated B+V1 or higher by A.M. Best or A or higher
Contractual Liability		by Standard & Poors
Business Auto Liability	1,000,000 combined single limit	City to be provided a waiver of subrogation
Workers' Compensation & Employers Liability	Statutory Limits 1,000,000 each accident	City to be provided a waiver of subrogation

Questions regarding this insurance should be directed to the City of Pflugerville (512)990-6100 A contract will not be issued without evidence of Insurance. We will only accept the ACORD 25 or ISO certificate of insurance forms.

# Form **W-9**

(Rev. December 2014)
Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

# Request for Taxpayer Identification Number and Certification

Give Form to the requester. Do not send to the IRS.

Internal	Revenue Service																				L					
	1 Name (as shown	on your incom	e tax return)	, Name is red	quire	ed on	this line	e; do	not le	leave t	this li	ine t	blan	ıĸ.												
	Chameleon II	ndustries !	lnc.																							
	2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above																									
α) C∕I		J	-																							
ğ								t f-D-	Daniela.		b								4 Ex	amp	tions	(code	s ac	o via	nly to	 o
0	3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification; check only <b>one</b> of the following seven boxes:  4 Exemptions (code: certain entities, not in certain entities.								ndiv																	
Ō		Individual/sole proprietor or Coliporation Ly 3 3 3/2/3/3/3/3/3/3/3/3/3/3/3/3/3/3/3/3									mandono on page 4).															
o ii	3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification; check only one of the following seven boxes:    Individual/sole proprietor or   C Corporation   S Corporation   Partnership   Trust/estate single-member LLC     Limited liability company. Enter the tax classification (C=C corporation, S=S corporation, P=partnership)     Note. For a single-member LLC that is disregarded, do not check LLC; check the appropriate box in the line above for the tax classification of the single-member owner.    Other (see instructions)     5 Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.)   P.O. Box 853027								Exempt payee code (if any)																	
€.₽									for Exemption from FATCA reporting																	
t o	Note. For a single-member LLC that is disregarded, do not check LLC, check the appropriate box in the time above to the tax classification of the single-member owner.									code																
Print or type	Other (see inst																		(Applie:					utside	ine U.S	.)
ப∷்	5 Address (number	, street, and a	pt. or suite r	10.)											Requ	ester's	s nam	ne a	ınd ad	dres	s (opt	ional	)			
eci	P.O. Box 85302		•																							
Sp	6 City, state, and Z								* *****																	
See	Mesquite TX 7													Ì												
S	1													L												<del></del>
	7 List account nun	iber(s) here (or	otional)																							
Pai	ti Taxpa	yer Identif	<u>fication</u>	Number	(11	IN)									•	l e.	Solal	cor	curity	2112	her					
Enter	your TIN in the ap	propriate box	k. The TIN	provided m	nust	t mate	ch the	name	ne giv	ven o	on lin	ne 1	l to	avo	lici ra		Juan	1	Turky	[	T	1				
backı	your TIN III the ap up withholding. For ent alien, sole prop	individuals,	this is gen	erally your s	SOCI	жан se Dart I	ecurity Linetru	/ NUME	no er	VICC) Inant	v). п ie 3	For	r otk	i, io her	ıa				-			_				
reside	ent allen, sole prop es, it is your emplo	rietor, or dist ver identifica	tion numb	er (FIN). If v	vou :	do no	ot hav	e a ni	numb	ber, se	see h	łow	v to	get	a	L					ļ <u>.</u>	j				
	n page 3.	yer raeritinea		. ( , ,												or										
	. If the account is i	n more than	one name.	see the ins	struc	ctions	is for li	ine 1 a	and	the c	chart	t on	ı pa	ige 4	4 for	E	mplo	yer	ident	fica	tion r	umb	er			
ouide	lines on whose nu	mber to ente	ř.																		80					
guidennes on whose number to offer.								7	5		- 2	8	5	3	0	0	0									
Par	Certifi	cation		*												•										
	r penalties of perju		nat.																							
Unide	e number shown o	ny, roominy d	e my corre	et tavnaver	r ide	entific	cation	numb	iber (	(or La	am w	vaiti	ina	for:	a nui	nber	to be	e is	sued	to r	ne); a	and				
1. Ir	ie number snown o	m this tonia i	S IIIy COITE	Ct taxpayor	iac	28 111110		1101112				atio o		- /h\	Lba		t boo	an i	notific	d b	u the	Inte	rnal	Rev	enue	<b>-</b>
2. la	m not subject to b ervice (IRS) that I a	ackup withh	olding bec	ause: (a) i a	am e	exem	ipt from	m bac failur	ickup re to	p wiin	nnou ortal	ainç ILint	g, o tere	er (D) est c	r div	ve no idenc	is o	ríc	the	RS	has r	notifi	ed r	ne tl	nat l	am
Se	ervice (IRS) that I a longer subject to	n subject to	packup wi holding: ar	uniolalny a nd	25 G	i i Cou	at OI a	landi	100	ropo	ort at						, -		,							
3. la	ım a U.S. citizen o	other U.S. p	erson (def	ined below	v); ar	nd																				
4. Th	e FATCA code(s) e	ntered on thi	is form (if a	ıny) indicati	ting t	that I	I am ex	xemp	pt fro	om FA	ATC,	A re	epo	erting	giso	orrec	t.									
Certi	fication instruction	ns. You mus	st cross ou	t item 2 abo	ove	if yo	ou have	e bee	en กo	otified	d by	the	e IRS	S th	at yo	u are	curi	reni	tly su	bjec	t to t	oack	up v	withr	JOIGII	ng
	use you have falled est paid, acquisition rally, payments oth																									
gene	rally, payments oth	er than inter	est and div	ilderius, you	Ju ai	I & FIOI	n requi	meu t	to sig	girai	IC 00	,, (1111	·Outi	,,,,	Dut	,				,						
	ctions on page 3.		1 -																							•
Sign		_ 0_	26-0	~										Da	te 🕨	20	Se	pt.	2018	}						
Her	e U.S. person																<del></del>									
	neral Instru								(tu	Form uition)	)						est),	109	8-E (si	ude	nt Ioa	n inte	erest	), 109	10-l	
0 13 -	n references are to t	na Internal Rev	enue Code	unless other	rwise	e note	∍d.		• 1	Form	1099	9-C	ícan	ncele	ed de	bt)										

Future developments. Information about developments affecting Form W-9 (such as legislation enacted after we release it) is at www.irs.gov/fw9.

#### Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an information return with the IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer identification number (TIN) which may be your social security number (SSN), individual taxpayer identification number (ITIN), adoption taxpayer identification number (ATIN), or employer identification number (EIN), to report on an information return the amount paid to you, or other amount reportable on an information return. Examples of information returns include, but are not limited to, the following:

- Form 1099-INT (interest earned or paid)
- Form 1099-DIV (dividends, including those from stocks or mutual funds)
- Form 1099-MISC (various types of income, prizes, awards, or gross proceeds)
- Form 1099-B (stock or mutual fund sales and certain other transactions by brokers)
- Form 1099-S (proceeds from real estate transactions)
- Form 1099-K (merchant card and third party network transactions)

• Form 1099-A (acquisition or abandonment of secured property)

Use Form W-9 only if you are a U.S. person (including a resident alien), to provide your correct TIN.

If you do not return Form W-9 to the requester with a TIN, you might be subject to backup withholding. See What is backup withholding? on page 2.

By signing the filled-out form, you:

- 1. Certify that the TiN you are giving is correct (or you are waiting for a number to be issued),
- 2. Certify that you are not subject to backup withholding, or
- 3. Claim exemption from backup withholding if you are a U.S. exempt payee. If applicable, you are also certifying that as a U.S. person, your allocable share of any partnership income from a U.S. trade or business is not subject to the withholding tax on foreign partners' share of effectively connected income, and
- 4. Certify that FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that you are exempt from the FATCA reporting, is correct. See What is FATCA reporting? on page 2 for further information.

# STANDARD GOVERNMENTAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASING RIDER FOR CONTRACTS WITH THE CITY OF PFLUGERVILLE, TEXAS

(Version 9/1/2017)

By submitting a response to a solicitation or bid, or by entering into a contract for goods or services and/or by accepting a purchase order, the contracting party identified below agrees that the below terms and conditions shall govern all agreements with the City unless otherwise agreed to by <u>a specifically executed provision</u> within the contract and if permissible by law. Absent a specifically executed provision, the below terms are BINDING and SUPERSEDE any and all other terms and/or conditions whether oral or written.

1. Application. This Governmental Rider applies to, is part of, and takes precedence over any conflicting provision in or attachment to the Contract (Contract) (attached hereto) of (Vendor). The Contract involved in this Rider is described as follows:
Title of Contract: <u>Bid # 2019-1 Water and Wastewater</u> Chemicals

- 2. Payment Provisions. The City's payments under the Contract, including the time of payment and the payment of interest on overdue amounts, are subject to Chapter 2251, Texas Government Code. The City reserves the right to modify any amount due to contractor presented by invoice to the City if necessary to conform the amount to the terms of the contract.
- 3. Multiyear Contracts. If the City does not appropriate funds to make any payment for a fiscal year after the City's fiscal year in which the contract becomes effective and there are no proceeds available for payment from the sale of bonds or other debt instruments, then the Contract automatically terminates at the beginning of the first day of the successive fiscal year. (Section 5, Article XI, Texas Constitution) It is understood and agreed the City shall have the right to terminate the agreement at the end of any City fiscal year if the governing body of the City does not appropriate funds sufficient to continue the contract, as determined by the City's budget for the fiscal year in question. The City may execute such termination by giving contractor a written notice of termination at the end of its then current fiscal year.
- 4. Best Value Determination. All competitive bids or proposals received shall be evaluated based on the best value for the City. Best value shall be determined by any relevant criteria specifically listed in the solicitation and by considering all or part of the criteria listed below.
  - a. Bid price
  - b. Reputation of the bidder and of bidder's goods and services
  - c. The quality of the bidder's goods or services
  - d. The extent to which the goods or services meet the City's needs
  - e. Bidder's past relationship with the City All vendors shall be evaluated on their past performance and prior dealings with the City to include, but not limited to, failure to meet specifications, poor quality, poor workmanship, and late delivery.
- 5. Local Preference. The City Council supports the local preference option for purchasing. In accordance with Chapter 271.9051 of the State of Texas Local Government Code, the City Council may choose to award a competitive bid to a bidder whose principal place of business is in the City limits, provided that this bid is within 5% of the lowest bid price received.
- 6. No Ex-Parte Communications during Competitive Bidding Period. To insure the proper and fair evaluation of a response, the City prohibits ex parte communication (e.g., unsolicited) initiated by the proposed contractor to a City official or employee evaluating or considering the responses prior to the time a formal decision has been made. Questions and other communication from vendors will be permissible until 5:00 pm on the day specified as the deadline for questions. Any communication between responder and the City after the deadline for questions will be initiated by the appropriate City official or employee in order to obtain information or clarification needed to develop a proper and accurate evaluation of the response. Ex parte communication may be grounds for disqualifying the offending responder from consideration or award of the solicitation then in evaluation, or any future solicitation.

- 7. Abandonment or Default. A contractor who abandons or defaults the work on the contract and causes the City to purchase the services elsewhere may be charged for any increased cost of goods, materials and/or services related thereto and shall be considered disqualified in any re-advertisement of the service and may not be considered in future bids for the same type of work for a period of three years for the same scope of work, goods or services.
- 8. Disclosure of Litigation. Each contractor shall include in its proposal a complete disclosure of any civil or criminal litigation or investigation pending which involves the respondent or which has occurred in the past in which the respondent has been judged guilty or liable by a competent court regardless of whether the Court Order or Judgment is final or on appeal.
- 9. Cancellation. The City reserves the right to cancel the contract without penalty by providing 30 days prior written notice to the contracting party. Termination under this paragraph shall not relieve the contractor of any obligation or liability that has occurred prior to cancellation. NOTE: This contract is subject to cancellation, without penalty, at any time the City deems the vendor to be non-compliant with contractual obligations.
- 10. Annual Vendor Performance Review. The City reserves the right to review the vendor's performance annually and to cancel all or part of the agreement (without penalty) or continue the contract through the next period.
- 11. Compliance with other laws and certification of eligibility to contract. Any offer to contract with the City shall be considered an executed certification that the contractor shall comply with all federal, state, and local laws, statutes, ordinances, rules and regulations, (as amended during the contracting period) and any orders and decrees of any court or administrative bodies or tribunals in any matter affecting the performance of the resulting agreement, including without limitation, immigration laws, workers' compensation laws, minimum and maximum salary and wage statutes and regulations, and licensing laws and regulations. Additionally, such offer shall indicate that the contractor has fully read and understood the terms and conditions for eligibility to contract with the City pursuant to Chapter 38 of the City's Ordinances and certifies they are in compliance with those local requirements. When requested, the contractor shall furnish the City with satisfactory proof of its compliance within 10 days or any contract with the City is void.
- 12. Compliance with all Codes, Permitting and Licensing Requirements. The successful contractor shall comply with all national, state and local standards, codes and ordinances as well as any other authorities that have jurisdiction pertaining to equipment and materials used and their application. None of the terms or provisions of the specification shall be construed as waiving any rules, regulations or requirements of these authorities. The successful bidder shall be responsible for obtaining all necessary permits, certificates and/or licenses to fulfill contractual obligations.
- 13. Liability and Indemnity of City. Any provision of the Contract is void and unenforceable if it: (1) limits or releases either party from liability that would exist by law in the absence of the provision; (2) creates liability for either party that would not exist by law in the absence of the provision; or (3) waives or limits either party's rights, defenses, remedies, or immunities that would exist by law in the absence of the provision. (Section 5, Article XI, Texas Constitution)
- 14. Indemnity and Independent Contractor Status of Contractor. Contractor shall indemnify, save harmless and defend the City, its officers, agents, and employees from and against any and all suits, actions, legal proceedings, claims, demands, damages, costs, expenses, attorney's fees and any and all other costs or fees (whether grounded in Constitutional law, Tort, Contract, or Property Law, or raised pursuant to local, state or federal statutory provision), arising out of the performance of the resulting agreement and/or arising out of a willful or negligent act or omission of the contractor, its officers, agents, and employees. It is understood and agreed that the contractor and any employee or subcontractor of contractor shall not be considered an employee of the City. The contractor shall not be within protection or coverage of the City's workers' compensation insurance, health insurance, liability insurance or any other insurance that the City from time to time may have in force and effect. City specifically reserves the right to reject any and all contractor's employees, representatives or sub-contractors and/or their employees for any cause, should the presence of any such person on City property or their interaction with City employees be found not in the best interest of the City, harassing, or is found to interfere with the effective and efficient operation of the City's workplace.
- 15. Liens. Contractor agrees to and shall indemnify and save harmless the City against any and all liens and encumbrances for all labor, goods and services which may be provided under the resulting agreement. At the City's

request the contractor or subcontractors shall provide a proper release of all liens, or satisfactory evidence of freedom from liens shall be delivered to the City.

- 16. Confidentiality. Any provision in the Contract that attempts to prevent the City's disclosure of information that is subject to public disclosure under federal or Texas law or regulation, or court or administrative decision or ruling, is invalid. (Chapter 552, Texas Government Code)
- 17. Tax Exemption. The City is not liable to Vendor for any federal, state, or local taxes for which the City is not liable by law, including state and local sales and use taxes (Section 151.309 and Title 3, Texas Tax Code), and federal excise tax (Subtitle D of the Internal Revenue Code) for certain purchases. Accordingly, those taxes may not be added to any item. Texas limited sales tax exemption certificates will be furnished upon request. Vendors shall not charge for said taxes. If billed, the City will remit payment less sales tax.
- 18. Contractual Limitations Period. Any provision of the Contract that establishes a limitations period that does not run against the City by law or that is shorter than two years is void. (Sections 16.061 and 16.070, Texas Civil Practice and Remedies Code)
- 19. Sovereign Immunity. Any provision of the Contract that seeks to waive the City's immunity from suit and/or immunity from liability is void unless agreed to by specific acknowledgement of the provision within the contract.
- 20. Governing Law and Venue. Texas law governs this Contract and any lawsuit on this Contract must be filed in a court that has jurisdiction in Travis County, Texas.
- 21. The City of Pflugerville may not enter into a contract with a company for goods and services unless the contract contains a written verification from the company that; (i) it does not Boycott Israel; and (ii) will not Boycott Israel during the term of the contract. (Texas government code chapter 2270) by accepting this purchase order, the vendor (Professional or other applicable term defining the contracting party) verifies that it does not Boycott Israel, and agrees that during the term of this agreement (contract as applicable) will not Boycott Israel as that term is defined in the Texas Government Code Section 808.001, as amended.

CITY OF PFLUGERVILLE, TEXAS	VENDOR	
Den	Jason L. Garza	
Ву:		
City Manager	Title: Vice President	
Date:	Date: 20 Sept 2018	

# REFERENCE SHEET Please complete and return this form with the Solicitation response

Bid No: 2019-1 Water and Wastewater Chemi	icals
Water and wastewater enorm	ons
Bidders Name: Chameleon I	ndustries Inc. Date 20 Sept 2018
utilized the chemical for at lea	lephone and point of contact of at least three firms that have ast 2 years. References will be checked prior to award. wed may result in disqualification of bid.
1. Company's Name	Trinity River Authority - Euless
Name of Contact	David Harris
Title of Contact	Chief Operator
E-Mail Address	harrisd@trinityra.org
Present Address	6500 W. Singleton Blvd.
City, State, Zip Code	Dallas TX (817 ) 267-4226 Fax Number ( )
Telephone Number	(817) 267-4226 Fax Number_()
2. Company's Name	City of Corsicana
Name of Contact	Doug Spain
Title of Contact	Navarro Mills Asst Superintendent
E-Mail Address	dspain@ci.corsicana.tx.us
Present Address	200 N 12th Street
City, State, Zip Code	Corsicana TX, 75110
Telephone Number	(903) 641-5785 Fax Number (254) 578-1846
3. Company's Name	City of Arlington
Name of Contact	Derek Littlejohn
Title of Contact	Plant Manager
E-Mail Address	Derek.Littlejohn@arlingtontx.gov
Present Address	1901-B Lakewood Dr.
City, State, Zip Code	Arlington, TX 76013
Telephone Number	(817)575-8940 Fax Number ( )

Failure to provide the required information with the solicitation response may automatically disqualify the response from consideration from award.



### Interlocal Cooperative Contracting

Other governmental entities within the State of Texas may be extended the opportunity to purchase off of the City of Pflugerville's solicitation, with the consent and agreement of the successful vendor(s) and the City of Pflugerville. Such consent and agreement shall be conclusively inferred from lack of exception to this clause in the vendor's response. However, all parties indicate their understanding and all parties hereby expressly agree that the City of Pflugerville is not an agent of, partner to, or representative of those outside agencies or entities and that the City of Pflugerville is not obligated or liable for any action or debts that may arise out of such independently-negotiated "piggyback" procurements.

Vendor Name:_	Chameleon Industries Inc.
Agree	
Disagree X	
Date: 20 Sept 20	18

PO Box 853027 CHAMELEON INDUSTRIES INC. MESQUITE, TX 75185

SER DIRECTION OF

Pflugerville City Hall Attn- Sabrina Schmidt 100 E Main St, Suite 100 Pflugerville, TX 78660